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Synopsis:
Alceán is a teenager who lives with his mother, shut away in an enormous and sinister mansion that he has
never left. The only world he has ever known does a one hundred and eighty degree turn when his Uncle
Belial makes an unexpected arrival, and pushes him to transgress every limitation his mother has ever
imposed upon him. And this is how Alceán will come to discover the terrible secrets kept by his family for
generations, including the truth regarding his own life of seclusion.
About "Flesh of Flesh":
“Flesh of Flesh” unites elements of the Gothic novel with the classic horror narrative (with prominent
influence from Edgar Allen Poe) in order to create a decadent and romantic ambience. The old mansion, the
sinister atmosphere, the family curse, heated emotions, and hidden eroticism are clear ingredients of this
tradition. Nevertheless, the narrative exceeds the canon of the Romantic Gothic novel, to the extent of
reaching dark elements of authentic horror in accordance with the contemporary canons, bordering on gore.
This entire palette of elements of the horror genre makes “Flesh of Flesh” an attractive feast for lovers of the
dark.
Narrated in first person, this long story, or short novel, recounts the childhood and youth of Alceán, its
protagonist, in a style that is both archaic and dreamlike, creating the sensation of listening to a memory
from illness, a feverish delirium, a sinister hallucination of a tormented being who tells us his visions, so that
we may share in his anguish. The poetic and impassioned style of the protagonist narrator does not prevent
the story from captivating the reader, advancing relentlessly until revealing its final, terrifying secret.
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From reader reviews:

John Sanchez:

Here thing why this Flesh of Flesh are different and trusted to be yours. First of all looking at a book is good
however it depends in the content from it which is the content is as delicious as food or not. Flesh of Flesh
giving you information deeper as different ways, you can find any guide out there but there is no reserve that
similar with Flesh of Flesh. It gives you thrill reading through journey, its open up your own eyes about the
thing this happened in the world which is maybe can be happened around you. You can easily bring
everywhere like in area, café, or even in your method home by train. If you are having difficulties in bringing
the branded book maybe the form of Flesh of Flesh in e-book can be your choice.

Adam Whittington:

The publication with title Flesh of Flesh has lot of information that you can understand it. You can get a lot
of help after read this book. This kind of book exist new understanding the information that exist in this
guide represented the condition of the world now. That is important to yo7u to learn how the improvement of
the world. This particular book will bring you in new era of the the positive effect. You can read the e-book
in your smart phone, so you can read that anywhere you want.

Gary Forsyth:

Beside this Flesh of Flesh in your phone, it could give you a way to get closer to the new knowledge or info.
The information and the knowledge you are going to got here is fresh from the oven so don't possibly be
worry if you feel like an outdated people live in narrow village. It is good thing to have Flesh of Flesh
because this book offers to your account readable information. Do you occasionally have book but you do
not get what it's all about. Oh come on, that will not end up to happen if you have this in the hand. The
Enjoyable option here cannot be questionable, similar to treasuring beautiful island. So do you still want to
miss the item? Find this book and also read it from today!

Christopher Hickman:

With this era which is the greater man or who has ability in doing something more are more special than
other. Do you want to become one of it? It is just simple approach to have that. What you need to do is just
spending your time not very much but quite enough to experience a look at some books. On the list of books
in the top collection in your reading list is Flesh of Flesh. This book that is qualified as The Hungry Slopes
can get you closer in turning out to be precious person. By looking upward and review this book you can get
many advantages.
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