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La novela introdujo los conceptos del omnipresente y vigilante Gran Hermano o Hermano Mayor, de la
notoria habitación 101, de la ubicua policía del Pensamiento y de la neolengua, adaptación del inglés en la
que se reduce y se transforma el léxico con fines represivos, basándose en el principio de que lo que no
forma parte de la lengua, no puede ser pensado. Muchos analistas detectan paralelismos entre la sociedad
actual y el mundo de 1984, sugiriendo que estamos comenzando a vivir en lo que se ha conocido como
sociedad orwelliana, una sociedad donde se manipula la información y se practica la vigilancia masiva y la
represión política y social. El término «orwelliano» se ha convertido en sinónimo de las sociedades u
organizaciones que reproducen actitudes totalitarias y represoras como las representadas en la novela. La
novela fue un éxito en términos de ventas y se ha convertido en uno de los más influyentes libros del siglo
XX.
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From reader reviews:

James Goodman:

Have you spare time for the day? What do you do when you have more or little spare time? Yeah, you can
choose the suitable activity with regard to spend your time. Any person spent their own spare time to take a
wander, shopping, or went to the particular Mall. How about open or maybe read a book eligible 1984
(Spanish Edition)? Maybe it is to be best activity for you. You know beside you can spend your time
together with your favorite's book, you can better than before. Do you agree with its opinion or you have
various other opinion?

Laverne Dunbar:

This 1984 (Spanish Edition) book is not really ordinary book, you have it then the world is in your hands.
The benefit you receive by reading this book is usually information inside this e-book incredible fresh, you
will get details which is getting deeper you actually read a lot of information you will get. This particular
1984 (Spanish Edition) without we recognize teach the one who looking at it become critical in considering
and analyzing. Don't be worry 1984 (Spanish Edition) can bring if you are and not make your bag space or
bookshelves' come to be full because you can have it inside your lovely laptop even phone. This 1984
(Spanish Edition) having very good arrangement in word in addition to layout, so you will not sense
uninterested in reading.

Karen Garcia:

Many people spending their period by playing outside with friends, fun activity together with family or just
watching TV the entire day. You can have new activity to shell out your whole day by looking at a book.
Ugh, ya think reading a book can really hard because you have to bring the book everywhere? It ok you can
have the e-book, bringing everywhere you want in your Cell phone. Like 1984 (Spanish Edition) which is
finding the e-book version. So , try out this book? Let's view.

James Longo:

In this era which is the greater man or who has ability to do something more are more important than other.
Do you want to become among it? It is just simple method to have that. What you should do is just spending
your time not much but quite enough to enjoy a look at some books. Among the books in the top list in your
reading list is 1984 (Spanish Edition). This book that is qualified as The Hungry Hillsides can get you closer
in turning into precious person. By looking way up and review this e-book you can get many advantages.
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