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Two destinies intersect in Broken April. The first is that of Gjor, a young mountaineer who (much against his
will) has just killed a man in order to avenge the death of his older brother, and who expects to be killed
himself in keeping with the provisions of the Code that regulates life in the highlands. The second is that of a
young couple on their honeymoon who have come to study the age-old customs of the place, including the
blood feud.
While the story is set in the early twentieth century, life on the high plateaus of Albania takes life back to the
Dark Ages. The bloody shirt of the latest victim is hung up by the bereaved for all to see?until the avenger in
turn kills his man with a rifle shot. For the young bride, the shock of this unending cycle of obligatory
murder is devastating. The horror becomes personified when she catches a glimpse of Gjor as he wanders
about the countryside, waiting for the truce of thirty days to end, and life with it. That momentary vision of
the hapless murderer provokes in her a violent act of revulsion and contrition. Her life will be marked by it
always.
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From reader reviews:

Nicholas Hess:

Inside other case, little men and women like to read book Broken April. You can choose the best book if you
love reading a book. Provided that we know about how is important a new book Broken April. You can add
knowledge and of course you can around the world by just a book. Absolutely right, due to the fact from
book you can understand everything! From your country right up until foreign or abroad you can be known.
About simple point until wonderful thing it is possible to know that. In this era, we are able to open a book or
maybe searching by internet product. It is called e-book. You can use it when you feel weary to go to the
library. Let's learn.

Marian Sheffield:

Nowadays reading books become more than want or need but also be a life style. This reading addiction give
you lot of advantages. The advantages you got of course the knowledge the particular information inside the
book which improve your knowledge and information. The information you get based on what kind of
reserve you read, if you want send more knowledge just go with education books but if you want experience
happy read one with theme for entertaining for instance comic or novel. Typically the Broken April is kind
of publication which is giving the reader unforeseen experience.

Patrick Bergeron:

Do you have something that you want such as book? The reserve lovers usually prefer to select book like
comic, quick story and the biggest you are novel. Now, why not trying Broken April that give your
entertainment preference will be satisfied simply by reading this book. Reading practice all over the world
can be said as the way for people to know world a great deal better then how they react when it comes to the
world. It can't be said constantly that reading habit only for the geeky person but for all of you who wants to
possibly be success person. So , for all of you who want to start reading as your good habit, you could pick
Broken April become your own starter.

Elizabeth McNeal:

Many people said that they feel uninterested when they reading a publication. They are directly felt that
when they get a half parts of the book. You can choose the book Broken April to make your own reading is
interesting. Your own personal skill of reading skill is developing when you just like reading. Try to choose
simple book to make you enjoy to see it and mingle the sensation about book and looking at especially. It is
to be initially opinion for you to like to open a book and learn it. Beside that the e-book Broken April can to
be a newly purchased friend when you're really feel alone and confuse with what must you're doing of this
time.
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