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Paul Adrien Maurice Dirac was one of the founders of quantum theory. He is numbered alongside Newton,
Maxwell and Einstein as one of the greatest physicists of all time. Together the lectures in this volume,
originally presented on the occasion of the dedication ceremony for a plaque honoring Dirac in Westminster
Abbey, give a unique insight into the relationship between Dirac's character and his scientific achievements.
The text begins with the dedication address given by Stephen Hawking at the ceremony. Then Abraham Pais
describes Dirac as a person and his approach to his work. Maurice Jacob explains how Dirac was led to
introduce the concept of antimatter, and its central role in modern particle physics and cosmology. This is
followed by David Olive's account of the origin and enduring influence of Dirac's work on magnetic
monopoles. Finally, Sir Michael Atiyah explains the deep and widespread significance of the Dirac equation
in mathematics.
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From reader reviews:

Charles Jones:

The book Paul Dirac: The Man and his Work can give more knowledge and also the precise product
information about everything you want. Why then must we leave the good thing like a book Paul Dirac: The
Man and his Work? A few of you have a different opinion about guide. But one aim this book can give many
facts for us. It is absolutely suitable. Right now, try to closer with the book. Knowledge or info that you take
for that, you may give for each other; you can share all of these. Book Paul Dirac: The Man and his Work
has simple shape but the truth is know: it has great and big function for you. You can seem the enormous
world by wide open and read a publication. So it is very wonderful.

Theresa Wilkins:

This Paul Dirac: The Man and his Work usually are reliable for you who want to be considered a successful
person, why. The main reason of this Paul Dirac: The Man and his Work can be among the great books you
must have is definitely giving you more than just simple looking at food but feed an individual with
information that maybe will shock your preceding knowledge. This book is actually handy, you can bring it
just about everywhere and whenever your conditions at e-book and printed versions. Beside that this Paul
Dirac: The Man and his Work giving you an enormous of experience including rich vocabulary, giving you
tryout of critical thinking that we understand it useful in your day task. So , let's have it and enjoy reading.

William Johnson:

That book can make you to feel relax. This particular book Paul Dirac: The Man and his Work was colourful
and of course has pictures on there. As we know that book Paul Dirac: The Man and his Work has many
kinds or type. Start from kids until young adults. For example Naruto or Investigator Conan you can read and
believe you are the character on there. Therefore , not at all of book tend to be make you bored, any it offers
you feel happy, fun and rest. Try to choose the best book in your case and try to like reading in which.

Lesley Dwyer:

A lot of book has printed but it differs from the others. You can get it by online on social media. You can
choose the very best book for you, science, comedian, novel, or whatever by simply searching from it. It is
named of book Paul Dirac: The Man and his Work. You can add your knowledge by it. Without causing the
printed book, it might add your knowledge and make an individual happier to read. It is most crucial that,
you must aware about book. It can bring you from one place to other place.
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