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In this trilogy by Jesus, are three jewels, each shining in its own way and illuminating the same truth: You
are not only human but divine, and you are meant to flourish and love one another. In words that are for
today, Jesus speaks intimately and directly to the reader of the secrets to peace, love, and happiness. He
explains the deepest of all mysteries: who you are and how you can live as he taught long ago. The three
books in The Jesus Trilogy were dictated to Gina Lake by Jesus and include Choice and Will, Love and
Surrender, and Beliefs, Emotions, and the Creation of Reality.

Choice and Will explores the complex, mysterious, and important question of who or what chooses. The
question is important because our choices shape our reality and determine our experience of it.

Love and Surrender explains the role that surrender plays in releasing us from bondage to our conditioning.
Surrender is the “miracle” that occurs when we are finally able to let go and let things be as they are.

Beliefs, Emotions, and the Creation of Reality explores the exciting arena of creation. It explains how beliefs
determine our internal reality and, consequently, our external reality and how to move beyond limiting
beliefs.

The three books in this trilogy are also available individually and can be read in any order.

From the Introduction: “Choice and will are what make it possible to move out of the negative and limiting
beliefs of the false self, which prevent or curtail the possibility of living a fuller, happier, and more loving
life. Love and surrender are what are necessary to be in the Heart—in one’s divine Essence—and to live
from there rather than from a more contracted ego-bound state of consciousness. Surrender is the mysterious
thing that happens when one lets go of, or gives up, the perspective and beliefs of the false self for the true
self. It is the miracle I have spoken of in other works of mine.” –Jesus
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From reader reviews:

Jesus Sandiford:

The book The Jesus Trilogy: Choice and Will / Love and Surrender / Beliefs, Emotions, and the Creation of
Reality gives you the sense of being enjoy for your spare time. You can use to make your capable far more
increase. Book can to become your best friend when you getting tension or having big problem using your
subject. If you can make studying a book The Jesus Trilogy: Choice and Will / Love and Surrender / Beliefs,
Emotions, and the Creation of Reality to get your habit, you can get considerably more advantages, like add
your personal capable, increase your knowledge about several or all subjects. You are able to know
everything if you like open up and read a publication The Jesus Trilogy: Choice and Will / Love and
Surrender / Beliefs, Emotions, and the Creation of Reality. Kinds of book are a lot of. It means that, science
book or encyclopedia or other individuals. So , how do you think about this guide?

Charlie Smith:

The reason? Because this The Jesus Trilogy: Choice and Will / Love and Surrender / Beliefs, Emotions, and
the Creation of Reality is an unordinary book that the inside of the reserve waiting for you to snap that but
latter it will jolt you with the secret this inside. Reading this book next to it was fantastic author who else
write the book in such incredible way makes the content interior easier to understand, entertaining method
but still convey the meaning completely. So , it is good for you because of not hesitating having this anymore
or you going to regret it. This excellent book will give you a lot of positive aspects than the other book
include such as help improving your proficiency and your critical thinking technique. So , still want to hold
up having that book? If I had been you I will go to the e-book store hurriedly.

Henry Carlino:

This The Jesus Trilogy: Choice and Will / Love and Surrender / Beliefs, Emotions, and the Creation of
Reality is great e-book for you because the content and that is full of information for you who have always
deal with world and possess to make decision every minute. This book reveal it info accurately using great
coordinate word or we can declare no rambling sentences included. So if you are read the item hurriedly you
can have whole facts in it. Doesn't mean it only provides you with straight forward sentences but tough core
information with wonderful delivering sentences. Having The Jesus Trilogy: Choice and Will / Love and
Surrender / Beliefs, Emotions, and the Creation of Reality in your hand like getting the world in your arm,
facts in it is not ridiculous one. We can say that no book that offer you world in ten or fifteen tiny right but
this reserve already do that. So , this is certainly good reading book. Hi Mr. and Mrs. busy do you still doubt
that will?

Effie Steger:

What is your hobby? Have you heard which question when you got students? We believe that that issue was
given by teacher to the students. Many kinds of hobby, Every individual has different hobby. And you know



that little person including reading or as studying become their hobby. You have to know that reading is very
important along with book as to be the issue. Book is important thing to incorporate you knowledge, except
your own teacher or lecturer. You see good news or update about something by book. A substantial number
of sorts of books that can you decide to try be your object. One of them are these claims The Jesus Trilogy:
Choice and Will / Love and Surrender / Beliefs, Emotions, and the Creation of Reality.
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